
Minutes of Meeting 23 November 2024


M. Graham Clark Chapter of the SAR


The meeting was called to order by President Alan Hiles at 9:00 a.m. in the Memorial 
Room of American Legion Post 202 located at 3669 Legion Lane, Columbia, MO 65201: 
http://americanlegionpost202.org/

There was no color guard.  The American Flag is perpetually posted in the Memorial 
Room where we meet. 

Chaplain Samuel Thomas offered the opening prayer.

The Pledge of Allegiance was led by President Hiles. The Pledge to the SAR was led by 
COM Hank Hammons, Leslie Fowler, and Stephanie Thomas.

A total of 23 members and guests were in attendance. See appended list.

Guests were introduced and included wives Waylene Hiles, Linda Coutts, Ruth Miller, 
Val Hammons, Leslie Fowler, Stephanie Thomas, and Special Friend of the Chapter: Dr. 
William Krause.

At 9:02, President Hiles announced a break for breakfast served in the ballroom. The 
menu was pancakes, scrambled eggs, sausage, biscuits and gravy, and beverages for 
$12, provided by the VFW and paid individually by members. 

President Hiles reconvened the meeting at 9:40 a.m.

COM Luke Lucas and wife Kathryn Anne celebrated their 55th wedding anniversary on 
November 12.

COM Raymond Miller and wife Ruth celebrated their 54th wedding anniversary on 
November 14.

Notable dates – November 5, 2024-General Election Day 

November 11-Veterans Day : COM Charlie Lee attended ceremony at Boone County 
Courthouse and COM Alan Hiles gave a program on the “St. Louis Browns” at the 
Primrose Retirement Center.

COM J. Y. Miller presented a program to the Altrusa Club of Sedalia on “Washington At 
Valley Forge” on Monday, 18 NOV and will present to the Moberly DAR Chapter later 
today on “The Battle of Glasgow”.
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Treasurer Paul Whatley handed out copies of the Treasurer’s report and reminded 
members that any member could request to look at the books by contacting him. COM 
J.Y. Miler Moved to “…thank the Treasurer and to file the report for audit.”   COM 
DeVenney seconded.Motion passed. COnsistent with MGC policy, the Treasurer’s 
report is not on the web page, but may be requested by any member.

 
COM Whatley also suggested the Chapter become a Life Member of the Friends of the 
SAR Library at a one-time cost of $1,000 (Informational brochure attached.) COM J.Y. 
Miller moved the Chapter do so and COM Russell Devenney seconded.  

After discussion, COM Mitchell Moore expressed support for the motion and moved, as 
a friendly amendment, that the motion be tabled and put on the agenda for the next 
meeting to give members sufficient advanced notice, due to the significant amount of 
money involved.  COM J. Y. Miller seconded the motion.  Amendment and primary 
motion passed.

COM Russell DeVenney encouraged members to consider contributing to the George 
Washington Endowment Fund to support NSSAR projects. Brochure attached.

COM Moore announced the minutes of the previous meeting are on the webpage.  No 
corrections were suggested by members. President Hiles pronounced the minutes 
accepted.

COM John Couts announced Brian Philips’ application had been approved.  Five 
applications have been sent to National for approval.  Eight other applications are in the 
earlier stages of the process. And a Supplement for COM Fred Blanco s closer to being 
approved as National is catching up with its backlog.  Genealogy Report of November 
23, 2024 is attached.

COM Wayne Merrill reported that he participated in uniform in the Apple Festival parade 
with the DAR in Versailles, MO as part of the celebrations of the 250th anniversary.  He 
also attended a grave marking in Farmington and Sweet Springs.  On December 8, 
2024, COM Merrill plans to attend the DAR hosted “Lights of Love” event in Boonville, 
MO.  https://missourilife.com/light-up-christmas-cheer/

COM Hank Hammons’ gave a slideshow presentation on the Steamboat Arabia. https://
www.1856.com/arabia-story.
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COM Hammons recounted the fascinating story of the Missouri River steamboat which 
perished in 1856 and was carefully recovered in 1988.  There is now a large museum in 
Kansas City displaying parts of the boat and its cargo. https://www.1856.com/ 
COM Hammons described very recently discovered research that showed the 
steamboat ran aground on a sandbar and prior to it being able to be freed, the sand 
beneath the steamboat was eroded away by the river and the boat sank too deep to 
recover at the time.

The treacherous waters of the Missouri River limited the lifespan of steamboat to an 
average of 2-3 years; less than the 4–5 year average lifespan of a steamboat on the 
Mississippi River.  

In 1988, 132 years after its sinking, interest in recovering the steamboat was renewed 
and extensive excavation work was conducted to bring it out of the field from which it lay 
buried.

The contents of the boat are now displayed in the museum and resemble an 1856 
department store with a wide variety of items, well preserved due to being buried in a 
cool place with little oxygen. COM Hammons shared many pictures of the items and 
described the challenges of recovering and preserving the items.

COM Hammons’ highly recommended the museum in Kansas City.

The 50-50 drawing for $15 was picked by COM Drayton Shepherd and was won by 
COM Alan Hiles.

The Chapter needs to designate a member with the task of keeping track of points.  We 
also need an Eagle Scout chairman.

COM J.Y. Miller will give a presentation at the December meeting entitled, “Silent Night.” 
We need program volunteers.

MOSAR officers will visit and present programs in the first months of 2025.

Members are reminded that the Chapter has its own Facebook page: https://
www.facebook.com/MGCSAR1776 and now a LinkedIn page; and also a video of 
highlights of this year.

Members are reminded about Youth Protection Certification and members can go to the 
website at:  https://www.sar.org/courses/youth-protection-training The online program is 
free and all members are encouraged to complete the program and be certified as soon 
as possible.
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A variety of online informational and orientation programs and courses are available via 
the SAR website at: https://www.sar.org/courses/

Of further interest may be the Official Handbook of the SAR, updated in 2022:

https://www.sar.org/wp-content/uploads/2022/02/NSSAR-Handbook-Volume-IV-06-
Feb-2022.pdf

Our Chapter website is at:  http://www.mgcsar.org/

The next meeting of the M. Graham Clark Chapter of the SAR will be December 21, 
2024 at 9:00 a.m. at the American Legion Post 202 located at 3669 Legion Lane, 
Columbia, MO 65201: http://mgcsar.org/legion.html 

There was no Color Guard; and the Stars and Stripes are permanently in place at the 
American Legion in each meeting room. 

The SAR recessional was then led by COM Hank Hammons followed by the closing 
prayer offered by Chaplain Samuel Thomas.

Meeting adjourned by President Hiles 
at 11:02 a.m.

Respectfully submitted, 

Mitchell Moore

Secretary
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